West Orange Public Schools West Orange, New Jersey 07052

BID SUMMARY AND CONTRACT AWARD RECOMMENDATION

On authorization of the Business Administrator formal bids were solicited for the Door Lock and Door Parts Bid 17-06. This solicitation was made by advertised Public Notice appearing in the Star Ledger on May 16, 2016.

Bids were sent to the following vendors:

Weilgus and Sons

Accredited Lock Supply

Independent Hardware

Bells Security Sales

DH Pace Company

Sealed bids were opened and read aloud on Thursday, June 2, 2016 at 10:30AM at the Administration Building in Room 111.

Those in attendance were:

Name

<u>Firm</u>

John Calavano

WOBOE

Robert Csigi

WOBOE

Kathy McCormick

WOBOE

John Kessler

Weilgus & Sons

Proposals were received from the following companies:

Weilgus & Sons

See attached pricing spreadsheet

Independent Hardware

See attached pricing spreadsheet

Accredited Lock

See attached pricing spreadsheet

Recommend award of a contract to Weilgus and Sons, Livingston, NJ for a period of two (2) years, July 1, 2016 – June 30, 2018, for door lock and door parts per the attached pricing spreadsheet (Lines 3-21 and 23-31). Weilgus and Sons has a one (1) year renewal option, July 1, 2018 – June 30, 2019, for door lock and door parts per the attached pricing spreadsheet.

Recommend award of a contract to Independent Hardware, Philadelphia, PA for a period of two (2) years, July 1, 2016 – June 30, 2018, for door lock and door parts per the attached pricing spreadsheet (Lines 1, 2 and 22). Independent Hardware has a one (1) year renewal option, July 1, 2018 – June 30, 2019, for door lock and door parts per the attached pricing spreadsheet.

| Door Lock and Door Parts 2 Year Pricing | | | |
|---|---------------|----------------------|-----------------|
| July 1, 2016 - June 30, 2018 | | | |
| | | | : |
| Line Part | Weigus & Sons | Independent Hardware | Accredited Lock |
| 1 Mortise Cylinder Shell for IC Cylinders | \$13.24 | \$6.74 | \$7.00 |
| 2 Dummy Mortise Cylinder 1 1/8 x 626 | \$4.20 | 53.76 | \$3.80 |
| 3 Norton 1604BC Door Closer | \$47.40 | \$49.06 | \$61.25 |
| 4 LNC 4041 XP Super Smooth Regular Arm door Closer | \$117.83 | \$196.77 | C160 75 |
| 5 LCN 4040-3049 H Cush Hold Open Door Closer Arm | \$60.98 | \$75.95 | \$86.75 |
| 6 Von Duprin 9927EO x US28 Exit Device | \$448.90 | \$710.47 | \$620.75 |
| 7 Von Duprin 99EO US28 Exit Device | \$296.99 | \$476.13 | \$415.75 |
| 8 Von Duprin 99DT Exterior Trim | \$63,00 | \$574.88 | \$85.75 |
| 9 Von Duprin 99NL Exit Device trim | \$67.49 | \$681.97 | \$91.75 |
| 10 Von Duprin 24VMULL 10025 KR4954 7' 6 Mullion | \$256.79 | \$423.22 | \$383.00 |
| 11 Markar Adams Rite B1923 Hinge RH | \$26.95 | \$35.00 | \$28.25 |
| 12 Markar Adams Rite B1923 Hinge LH | \$26.95 | \$35.00 | \$28.25 |
| 13 Best Padlock 41B7-22-L Less Core | \$14.10 | No Bid | \$22.95 |
| 14 Don Jo CLP110-32D Latch Protector | \$10.64 | \$11.94 | \$12.00 |
| 15 Don Jo #9K-S-CW | \$7.33 | \$7.98 | \$10.50 |
| 16 Don Jo #EF-86 | \$1.66 | \$2.02 | \$1.85 |
| 17 Don Jo #FPK-161 | \$3.44 | \$5.16 | \$5.00 |
| 18 Push Plate US284 x 16 | \$3.39 | \$9.77 | \$4.25 |
| 19 Peaks Cylinder Caps (bag of 500) | \$4.54 | No Bid | \$6.00 |
| 20 Segment Springs (bag of 500) | \$13.70 | No Bid | \$15.00 |
| 21 Peak Core Segments Various Sizes (bag of 500) | \$3.74 | No Bid | \$4.00 |
| 22 Key Tags 1 1/4" (box of 50) | \$10.00 | \$5.55 | \$6.85 |
| 23 ICB Best Peaks Core | \$13:20 | No Bid | \$20.50 |
| 24 ICB Best Peaks Core with factory pinning | \$23,10 | No Bid | \$35.90 |
| 25 IAK Peaks Key (box of 50) | \$102,41 | No Bid | \$102.50 |
| Cylindrical lockset Heavy Duty Dormitory Function, 2 3/4" | | | |
| backset, SFIC, Hard Return Lever, Non Step Rose, ANSI Strike, | | | |
| 26 Lost Motion, 626 Finish-less core, BEST Security | \$129.88 | No Bid | \$222.25 |
| 27 Rim Cylinders Best 7Pin 12E-7-2-52-626 | \$14.20 | \$26.89 | \$22.25 |
| 28 Major FB-2L Locking Bar 2 Drawer File Bar | \$17.90 | \$29.73 | \$29.15 |
| 29 Major FB-2L Locking Bar 3 Drawer File Bar | \$17.90 | \$34.05 | \$30.00 |
| 30 Major FB-2L Locking Bar 4 Drawer File Bar | \$18.20 | \$39.55 | \$35.15 |
| 31 Wajor FB-2L Locking Bar 5 Urawer File Bar | \$19.79 | \$19.79 | \$40.25 |